
 

 

 

Bible Verse: 

“I can do all things 

through Christ who 

strengthens me” Phil. 4:13 

 

Learning this Month 

Literacy –  

• Letters: Y, V, K, Q, X Rainbow letters, 

review: S, W, R, B / Upper case, Letter 

sounds 

Math –  

• Making patterns 

• Counting 1-20  

Art –  

• Healthy, Happy Me – Xray, 

mouth/teeth 

• Rainbows 

• Van Gough Sheep 

• Making a planet 

Bible Stories – 

• Moses/Parting of the Red Sea Ex. 14 

• Samson – Judges 15 

• Easter Celebrations – Baptism of Jesus 

Luke 3 

Music –Love the Lord your God, Old Grey Cat, 

Rubberband Man, Who let the manners out. 

Fine Motor –  

• Writing in our journals, names, 
stickers 

Science – 
• Creating healthy habits 

• Solar System 

Social & Emotional – 

• Learning to cooperate, have self-

control, being intentional.  

• How to problem solve & make good 

choices  

• How to be a good friend/empathize  

• Take turns speaking & listen during 

circle time. 

 

Hard to believe we are in March! 
March is a wonderful Busy Bee 
month with many important 
activities.  
 
Upcoming next week is our Trike-A-
Thon! This is one of our fundraisers 
for our school.  
 
In our classroom, a special book 
bag has begun to go home, one 
child at a time. This is a special bag 
of books, and special materials to 
write their classmate. Stamps are 
included. Have fun and please 
return on the next day of school.  
 
We will begin our Solar System 
Planet in two weeks. Each year the 
children take home a Styrofoam 
ball to decorate as their special 
planet. They will return it to class 
and share with their friends. We 
will keep these for our Art Gala in 
April.  Going home Monday will be 
a bag containing a Styrofoam ball, 
instructions, and information sheet. 
They will have 3 full weeks to 
complete this assignment. Please 
let me know if you have any 
questions! This is a real fun project, 
and it is so neat to see how creative 
they are! They are all marvelous!  
~Mrs. Hammer 
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Upcoming March Events 

March 6, 7 8th - Trike-A-Thon  
Please check your child’s backpack for 
details. You may sign up to volunteer: 
Trike-A-Thon Volunteer 

 
March 11 – Rainbows and Light 
 
March 11 – 15th – Act of Kindness – 
Your child will make a bag with a 
special item and hand them out to 
brighten someone’s day as an Act of 
Kindness.  
Feb 26 – March 12th – Butterbraid 
sales: Butterbraids’ Spring 2024 
online link 

 
March 13, 14, 15 – St. Patrick’s Day 
Celebration. Hunting for coins. 
 
March 20, 21 – Easter Celebrations 
 
Please check the all-wide newsletter 
for more information and volunteer 
opportunities.  
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